BERMUDA

HEALTH INSURANCE (ADDITIONAL BENEFITS) AMENDMENT ORDER 2025

BR 112 / 2025

The Minister responsible for health, in exercise of the power conferred by
sections 13(2) and 13B of the Health Insurance Act 1970, makes the following Order:

Citation

1 This Order, which amends the Health Insurance (Health Insurance Plan)
(Additional Benefits) Order 1988 and the Health Insurance (FutureCare Plan) (Additional
Benefits) Order 2009 may be cited as the Health Insurance (Additional Benefits)
Amendment Order 2025.

Amends the Health Insurance (Health Insurance Plan) (Additional Benefits) Order
1988

2 The Schedule to the Health Insurance (Health Insurance Plan) (Additional
Benefits) Order 1988 is amended—

(@) by inserting the following after paragraph 8—
“8A. One Annual Health Exam (Physical), up to $250 for non-

complex cases and up to $350 for complex cases, plus ancillary
laboratory and diagnostic imaging services.”;

(b) by amending paragraph 13A(1)—

(i) by deleting “Subject to subparagraphs (2), (3) and (34A), the” and
substituting “The”;

(ii) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$15” and substituting “$17.13”;
(c) by revoking paragraphs 13A(2), 13A(3) and 13A(3A);




HEALTH INSURANCE (ADDITIONAL BENEFITS) AMENDMENT ORDER 2025

(d) by amending paragraph 13C by deleting “$1,000” and substituting
“$3,000”.

Amends the Health Insurance (FutureCare Plan) (Additional Benefits) Order 2009

3 The Schedule to the Health Insurance (FutureCare Plan) (Additional Benefits)
Order 2009 is amended—

(@) by inserting the following after paragraph 1—
“1A. One Annual Health Exam (Physical), up to $250 for non-

complex cases and up to $350 for complex cases, plus ancillary
laboratory and diagnostic imaging services.”;

(b) by amending paragraph 2 by deleting “$3,000” and substituting
«$5’000»;

() by amending paragraph 9B(1)—

(i) by deleting “Subject to subparagraphs (2), (3) and (34), the” and
substituting “The”;

(ii) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$15” and substituting “$17.13”;
(d) by revoking paragraphs 9B(2), 9B(3) and 9B(3A).

Made this 5th day of December 2025

Minister of Health

[Operative Date: 08 December 2025]




