
FA ER
N

AT F
TQUO U

BERMUDA

EMPLOYMENT (MINIMUM HOURLY WAGE) AMENDMENT ORDER 2025

BR 60 / 2025

The Minister responsible for labour, in exercise of the power conferred by section
11 of the Employment (Wage Commission) Act 2019 and acting in accordance with the
recommendation of the Wage Commission, makes the following Order:

Citation
This Order, which amends the Employment (Minimum Hourly Wage) Order 2023

(the "principal Order"), may be cited as the Employment (Minimum Hourly Wage)
Amendment Order 2025.

Amends paragraph 3
Paragraph 3(1) of the principal Order is amended by deleting “$16.40” and

substituting “$17.13”.

Amends paragraph 4
Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended by deleting “$16.40” at both

occurrences and substituting “$17.13”.

Commencement
This Order shall come into operation on 1 September 2025.

1

2

3

4

1



EMPLOYMENT (MINIMUM HOURLY WAGE) AMENDMENT ORDER 2025

Made this 17th day of July 2025

 

Minister of Economy and Labour

[Operative Date: 01 September 2025]

2


